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SUMMARY

This report documents my involvement in reference to this incident.

I was dispatched to 12th/ Irving to assist blocking eastbound traffic at the intersection.
 
I arrived on scene at approximately 1312hrs and was released from my position at 1435hrs.
 
This concludes my involvement in reference to this incident.

NARRATIVE

On 5/20/2022 at approximately 1311hrs, while on duty and in full uniform, operating marked squad
I15, body worn camera activated, I, Officer Cruz-Ortiz was dispatched to the area of 12th/ Irving Pl
to assist with blocking eastbound traffic traveling on 12th St.
 
I arrived on scene at approximately 1312 hours and was relieved at approximately 1435hrs. 
 
This concludes my involvement in reference to this incident.
 
EOR
Cruz-Ortiz 9503
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SUMMARY

This report supplements the incident report. I assisted with searching the glove box of the suspect's
vehicle in an attempt to locate identifying documents. I also assisted with scene security at the
traffic stop location.

NAMES

   
Police Officer-1
   Arvai, David RAPD1263 II  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-2
   Brenner, Zachary RAPD4895  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

=============================================================================

VEHICLE

Suspect
   Make: Volkswagon   
   Plate#:    Vin#:    
---------------------------------------------------------------------------

NARRATIVE

On 5/20/22, I, Sgt Juan Garcia, responded to Center St and Carroll St in reference to assisting
during a traffic stop with an officer involved shooting. Upon arrival, I directed officers to start
securing the scene with crime tape to prevent citizens from entering the area. I observed Officer
Brenner, who was directly involved in the incident, being escorted into a squad vehicle. I briefly
attempted to read Officer Brenner the Public Safety Statement but he advised it was already read to
him.  
 
I then made contact with Sgt. Comstock who requested I go to the traffic stop scene and manage
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that. I made contact with K9 Officer Arvai who was standing by the mentioned vehicle. Sgt
Comstock requested we attempt to locate any identifying documents for the suspect. I assisted with
searching the glove box while Officer Arvai searched the center console which are two common
areas to locate identifying documents. I did not locate any in the glove box and observed Officer
Arvai searching the center console. Inside the center console, I could see a plastic baggie with an
off-white chunky substance believed to be crack cocaine. The baggie was left in the center console.
 
I then assisted with maintaining scene security as small groups began forming at different
intersections but did not cause any issues. I was then released from my assignment to begin
another assignment for the Crowd Control Team.
 
I would later respond back to the area to assist with crowd control issues which were not observed
by myself. This concluded my involvement with this incident.
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SUMMARY

This report supplements the Incident Report under the same complaint number. This report details
my role in responding to an Officer Involved Shooting. I performed crowd control duties on scene
and at Ascension All Saints Hospital. Those duties were the extent of my role in this investigation.

NAMES

   
Police Officer-1
   Brenner, Zachary RAPD4895  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-2
   Comstock, Ryan RAPD1205  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-3
   Ditscheit, Michael RAPD1778  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-4
   Fenderson, LaVontay RAPD9216  B/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-5
   Powell, Walter RAPD1324  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

=============================================================================
NARRATIVE
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On 05/20/2022, at approximately 1301 hours, I was working in the Traffic Bureau when I heard what
I thought was Officer (OFC) ZACHARY BRENNER call out that he was chasing someone and shots
were fired. Traffic Investigator (TI) MICHAEL DITSCHEIT and I immediately grabbed our gear and
got into marked squad R-3 and responded to the area of Center Street and Carroll Street. While we
were en route, Sergeant (SGT) RYAN COMSTOCK advised that he needed squads at that
intersection to assist with crowd control. Upon arrival, TI DITSCHEIT and I noted OFC LAVONTAY
FENDERSON was actively stringing crime scene tape across Carroll Street. TI DITSCHEIT and I
then expanded the crime scene zone by stringing crime scene tape along Center Street, completely
blocking all of Carroll Street and the open field to the immediate south of Carroll Street. After putting
up the crime scene tape, TI DITSCHEIT and I noted that there were several residents of the
apartment building on the north side of Carroll Street that were out in the yard. Many of the
residents were walking back and forth, east and west, on the south side of the apartment building,
so we positioned ourselves on Carroll Street, immediately adjacent to the apartment building to
ensure that the residents of the apartment building stayed on the property. We stayed at this
location for quite some time, until we were advised by SGT COMSTOCK that more assistance was
needed at Ascension All Saints Hospital, as a crowd was gathering there.

Upon being relieved from our position on Carroll Street, TI DITSCHEIT and I responded to the
emergency room area of Ascension All Saints Hospital. By the time we arrived there, numerous
Officers were already on scene and we were advised by Lieutenant (LT) WALTER POWELL that
the crowd which had formed at the hospital had already departed. LT POWELL advised TI
DITSCHEIT and I that we were no longer needed at the hospital. At that point, we went back in
service to assist with taking calls for service. That concluded my role in this incident. 

T.I. DANIEL NELSON #1351           Transcribed: sm 05/21/2022
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SUMMARY

On 05/20/2022, I was contacted, while off duty, about an Officer Involved Shooting that occurred in
the area of 12th Street and Schiller Street. I was further advised that the Officer Involved Shooting
involved a Racine Police Officer and the suspect was believed to be deceased. I know, based on
my training and experience, that an outside agency would be required to investigate the shooting,
but that additional tasks would need to be performed by Racine Police Department Officers due to
the gravity of this type of incident. I then responded into the Police Department as part of my duties
as the Lieutenant of the General Investigations Unit and a member of the SWAT Team. 

My Body Worn Camera was activated during a portion of my involvement in this case.

NAMES

   
Police Officer-1
   BeBow, Jeffrey RAPD1916  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-2
   Brenner, Zachary RAPD4895  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-3
   Burinda, William RAPD2716  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-4
   Hoover, Todd RAPD1900  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   

1 Of 5

Racine Police Department (RAPD) Supplemental Report

22-019620 Twelfth St/Schiller St, Racine, WI, 53403

5499                                              
Original CFS Code - 1: New CFS Code -1 : New CFS Code - 2:

05/20/2022

Freidel, Hanns K.
Payroll Number :

Payroll Number :

05/21/20221189

Freidel, Hanns K. 1189



Continuation           

Reporting Officer(s): Pages::

Incident  Report Number Incident Location: Incident Date:

Police Officer-5
   Ide, Edward RAPD1193  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Deceased
   King, Dashontay L  
          
          
       

            

   
Police Officer-6
   Ortiz, Robert RAPD1329  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-7
   Toeller, Richard RAPD1561  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

=============================================================================
NARRATIVE

On 05/20/2022, at approximately 1318 hours, I received aphone call from Sergeant (SGT) ROBERT
ORTIZ, who was on duty as the Sergeant ofthe General Investigations Unit. SGTORTIZ advised
that we just had an Officer Involved Shooting (OIS) in the areaof 12th Street and Schiller Street and
the Officer involved wasC.O.P. Officer (OFC) ZACHARY BRENNER. SGTORTIZ further advised
that the party that had been shot by OFC BRENNER wasdeceased. I know, based on my
trainingand experience, that OIS that result in the death of a suspect, require anoutside agency to
investigate. I alsoknow that these types of incidents require a large workforce due to the gravityof
the incident. I advised SGT ORTIZthat I would be responded to the Racine Police Department
(RAPD) to assist inthe investigation/administrative tasks.

Upon my arrival, I met with Deputy Chief (DC) RICHARDTOELLER, who was in command of the
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incident. DC TOELLER informed me that he was working on contacting outsideagencies to see who
would be responding to investigate the OIS. DC TOELLER requested that I have CriminalistTODD
HOOVER take overall photographs of OFC BRENNER, who was at RAPD in thesecond floor
lounge, to show his condition and what equipment he was wearingduring the incident. 

I had Criminalist HOOVER respond to RAPD, at which time OFCBRENNER was brought to the ID
Unit where overall photographs were taken. At this time, none of OFC BRENNER's equipmentwas
removed, examined, or taken from him. 

A short time later, I was advised via a phone call from DCTOELLER, who was now at the
Command Post in the area of 12th Streetand Schiller Street where the incident occurred, that DCI
would be responding fromMadison and they were to head the investigation. I was requested to have
photographs taken ofOFC BRENNER's pistol, the magazine inside his pistol, the two magazinesthat
he carried on his person, and all of his ammunition. I wasalso requested to take this equipment from
OFC BRENNER, have it secured in anevidence vault, and then re-issue him a new pistol, new
pistolmagazines, and duty ammunition. 

OFC BRENNER was then brought from the second floor lounge,back into the ID Bureau, along with
his WPPA rep and RAPD RPA rep, OFC WILLIAMBURINDA. Also in the ID Bureau with mewere
Criminalist HOOVER, Lieutenant (LT) EDWARD IDE, and SGT JEFFREY BEBOW. During this
portion, our Body Worn Cameraswere activated. Criminalist HOOVER againtook photographs of
OFC BRENNER while he was in uniform and asked him to removehis duty belt. Criminalist
HOOVER thentook photographs of OFC BRENNER's duty belt, OFC BRENNER's pistol, the
magazinein OFC BRENNER's pistol, and the single 9mm round in the chamber. It should be noted
that OFC BRENNER's dutyweapon is a Glock 17 9mm pistol. The serialnumber was photographed
by Criminalist HOOVER. I then counted the rounds that were in the magazine that was inserted
inOFC BRENNER's pistol. I counted a totalof  rounds of 9mm ammunition in his pistol. Those 
rounds, along with the single round of ammunition that was chamberedin his pistol, made rounds
in his firearm. 

Criminalist HOOVER then removed the two magazines that werein OFC BRENNER's outer carrier. 
These werethe only two additional magazines OFC BRENNER had on his person. The magazines
were photographed and then I countedeach round in both magazines. In magazine#1, I counted a
total of  9mm rounds, which is  capacity. In magazine #2, Icounted a total of rounds,
which is  capacity for this magazine.
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Every round of ammunition was counted again and verified bySGT BEBOW. SGT BEBOW told me
he had thesame round counts as I had, which again were in OFC BRENNER's holsteredpistol,

 in magazine #1, and in magazine #2.

SGT BEBOW and I then loaded up three new magazines withFederal Premium 9mm rounds of
ammunition and these magazines were issued to OFCBRENNER, along with a new Glock 17 9mm
pistol,  . Once OFC BRENNER was issued his new pistoland three new
magazines topped off with 9mm ammunition, I turned my Body WornCamera off.

Criminalist HOOVER locked up OFC BRENNER's pistol,magazines, and rounds of ammunition into
the ID Bureau evidence vault so thatDCI could take custody of this equipment at a later time.

I did not remove any additional equipment or examine anyother pieces of OFC BRENNER's
equipment at this time. This was done at the request of DCI. 

Once this process was complete, OFC BRENNER was requested togo with LT IDE and SGT
BEBOW, along with representation, to a clinic tocomplete a legal blood draw. This isstandard
procedure in OIS investigations. 

This concluded my involvement in OFC BRENNER's OISinvestigation. 

I then moved on to my secondary assignment, which was todress for the SWAT Team in case civil
unrest broke out due to the OISincident.

During the course of this investigation, I learned that the suspect in this case was DASHONTAY
KING and that he was driving a rented 2021 Gray Volkswagen Atlas. This information was
significant to me because the evening before, between the hours of 17:30 and 21:30 hours, the
Violent Crime Task Force, along with several members of the second shift detective bureau, were
on a special assignment to curb gun violence. Part of that assignment was to look for this vehicle as
we knew that SIU had received information that the occupants of the rented VW were armed with
firearms. SIU OFC S KELAND had a signed search warrant for the vehicle so if we were to locate it,
we were going to stop it and execute the search warrant. My team (SGT ORTIZ, INV
RASMUSSEN, INV KLEPEL, INV SMETANA, INV MITCHELL, INV SCARVERS, INV ZINNEN, and
myself) did not locate the vehicle that night. This is the same vehicle that OFC BRENNER stopped
on 05/20/22 that led to the OIS.  
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LT HANNS FREIDEL #1189             Transcribed: sm 05/21/2022
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SUMMARY

     
● Reported to ER as additional security.

     
● Activated for SWAT, on stand by.

NAMES

   
Police Officer
   Powell, Walter RAPD1324  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

=============================================================================
NARRATIVE

    On 5/20/22 at approximately 1330 hrs, I, Officer Lauer, was notified by Lt. Powell to return to
work and report to Ascension ER for additional security due to an Officer involved shooting. 
 
     Upon arrival to the ER, in full uniform with body camera worn, I reported in to Lt. Powell. I then
maintained a position as security in the main hallway between the lobby and ER. At approximately
1515 hours, I was notified to report to the PD Auditorium as SWAT had been activated. Lt. Powell
was advised and okay'd by release from my position at the ER. I then remained at the PD on stand
by for the remainder of the incident. 
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SUMMARY

I responded to the area of Center St and Carrol St for a reported officer involved shooting where the
suspect was deceased. I was not needed at the scene as multiple other
officers/investigators/supervisors had already secured the scene upon my arrival. I was then asked
to make Ascension All Saints Emergency Department to assist with crowd control. After being
released by Sgt Pettis from the hospital I was released at the Racine Police Department by Sgt
Ortiz. 

NAMES

   
Police Officer-1
   Brenner, Zachary RAPD4895  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-2
   Carson, Christopher RAPD7160  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Deceased
   King, Dashontay L  
        
         
       

            

   
Police Officer-3
   Ortiz, Robert RAPD1329  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-4
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   Pettis, James RAPD0099  B/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-5
   Powell, Walter RAPD1324  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

=============================================================================
Body Worn Camera Used

NARRATIVE

On 5/20/22 at approximately 0115 hours I was notified that an officer involved shooting had
occurred near 12th St and Schiller St. I made the area which was already secured by numerous
officers to see if further assistance was needed. I made the area of Carrol St and Center St and
walked east on Carrol St and observed other officers setting up a tent to protect evidence from the
incident in a field to the south of 1120 Center St. I did not observe the items in the field. I spoke with
SGT ORTIZ who gave me a brief of what he knew about the incident. I was told that OFC
BRENNER had initiated a traffic stop in the area of 12th St and Schiller St and the suspect vehicle
had pulled into a driveway to the south of the field and an occupant fled on foot, identified as
DASHONTAY KING, and he displayed a handgun which resulted in OFC BRENNER firing is duty
weapon at the suspect and striking the suspect. I was notified life saving measures were attempted,
KING was transported to Ascension All Saints hospital and was deceased. I was then asked to
respond to the hospital as it had been reported a crowd was gathering there.  
 
INV CARSON and I made All Saints ER to assist. A small gathering of people (approximately 10
-20) were outside the ER entrance and eventually dispersed. I was told I was no longer needed at
the hospital by SGT PETTIS and made RAPD. At RAPD SGT ORTIZ advised I was free to go
home. 
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SUMMARY

Traffic stop on a targeted vehicle and the driver fled from RPD officer. 
 
Officer involved shooting.

NAMES

   
Mentioned-1
     
             
                
      

            

   
Mentioned-2
   Barker, Chelsea RAPD10236  W/F of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7842   

   
Police Officer-1
   Blackmore, Christopher RAPD1264  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-2
   Brenner, Zachary RAPD4895  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-3
   Johnson, Matthew RAPD8809  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   
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Deceased
   King, Dashontay L  
          
          
       

            

   
Police Officer-4
   Klinkhammer, Kevin RAPD1987  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-5
   Mitchell, Alicia RAPD2718  W/F of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-6
   Ortiz, Robert RAPD1329  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-7
   Powell, Walter RAPD1324  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-8
   Toeller, Richard RAPD1561  W/M of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   

   
Police Officer-9
   Tredo, Rachel RAPD7301  W/F of 730 Center St, Racine,WI,53403

   Phone 1:(262) 635-7700   
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=============================================================================
NARRATIVE

I, Investigator (INV) TONYA SCARVERS, was part of the aftermath of the traffic stop that occurred
at 12th Street and Schiller Street. Prior to my arrival on the scene, I observed what I believed to be
our target vehicle being a Volkswagen Atlas gray in color with tinted windows heading eastbound
on Washington Avenue approaching 12th Street and taking a left and heading east. I was unable to
get the license plate off of the vehicle but had knowledge of the concern with the vehicle from the
night before.

On 05/19/2022, I, INV SCARVERS, along with the Violent Crime Task Force Supervisors and
Investigators conducted an operation where the Volkswagen Atlas in question was a target. We
were unable to locate that said vehicle and continued on with our operation. The next day, being
05/20/2022, is when I observed the vehicle go past me in an opposite direction on Washington
Avenue but was unable to get the license plate of the vehicle. Upon returning back on Washington
Avenue eastbound I, INV SCARVERS, began to hear radio transmission from Officer (OFC)
ZACHARY BRENNER involving that same Volkswagen Atlas truck in a traffic stop. The radio
transmission from OFC BRENNER was that he was conducting a traffic stop at 12th Street and
Schiller Street, that the vehicle had pulled into a driveway, and the party was running. I then recall
the transmission coming over is that a party had been shot and that OFC BRENNER was asking for
Rescue and gave out his location of Carroll Street.

Upon my arrival at 12th Street and Schiller Street, I parked my vehicle just west of 908 12th Street
and observed the gray Volkswagen Atlas with the driver's side door open and I could hear a party
yelling up over the embankment onto Carroll Street. I then went into the yard next door to 908 12th
Street and climbed over the embankment and up the hill to assist in what was happening on Carroll
Street.

Upon my arrival on Carroll Street, I observed OFC RACHEL TREDO and OFC MATTHEW
JOHNSON giving  to a male black party. They were switching off with their efforts to give
lifesaving measures. OFC BRENNER was already speaking with Deputy Chief RICHARD
TOELLER. I retrieved a paper bag from one of the squad cars with assistance from another Officer
to put the male black's belongings in which I believed to be a lighter and cash and no ID. Rescue
responded to the scene and took over lifesaving measures and transported the male black, later
identified as DASHONTAY KING, to the hospital.

Upon my arrival at the hospital, medical staff was just calling the time of death and the male black
was transported to a separate part of the ER where it was less congested with other patients. OFC 
TREDO stood by while the body laid at rest in the room. Efforts were still being made to identify
who the male black was. I received a call from INV KEVIN KLINKHAMMER to confirm whether or
not the male black had a tattoo of "yolo" tattooed on his neck. I confirmed with INV CHRISTOPHER
BLACKMORE who checked and confirmed that yes indeed he had that and the attempts to make
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positive identification of being DASHONTAY KING was becoming more positive.

I continued to stand watch at St. Mary's ER checking with different groups of what would be needed
and observed several people outside of the hospital, inside the vestibule, and inside the ER very
upset, yelling, and wanting answers. Two females in particular who claimed to be KING's sisters,
one being  and another female black were brought back to the family room
where they refused to go in for fear of past experiences in the room while Lieutenant WALTER
POWELL spoke with them reference what was going on at the hospital. He advised both ladies that
he was not on the scene, could not give any information of what was going on, but that the doctor
needed to speak with them reference KING. The ER doctor who assisted in aiding medical
treatment to KING advised both ladies what had occurred medically and then they became very
loud, boisterous, and were escorted out of the ER back to the very upset and angry crowd. At times
the crowd outside the ER had swollen to approximately 30-40 people but no incident occurred from
the groups' gathering.

After DCI and four Milwaukee Police Department Investigators finally responded to the ER to
investigate the incident, we were released from the hospital by the Racine County Sheriff's
Department who stood guard on the body and also the perimeter of the hospital. It should be noted
that I on the scene of Carroll Street gave the belongings of KING to OFC JOHNSON to handle.

Once back at the Racine Police Department I spoke with Sergeant (SGT) ROBERT ORTIZ who
advised that they had been receiving and monitoring social media accounts with the assistance of
CHELSEY BARKER the Crime Analysis party and there was possibly a protest amidst. I advised
that I could stay a bit longer and do recon on the city to see if there were groups gathering. Myself,
SGT ORTIZ, INV ALICIA MITCHELL, and a few others went out to drive around the city to observe
if there was going to be any civil unrest. At the time that we spent out there, there was not any
issues or concerns and that ended the night.

INV TONYA SCARVERS #1601         Transcribed: dr 05/24/2022

4 Of 4

Racine Police Department (RAPD)

22-019620 05/20/2022Twelfth St/Schiller St, Racine, WI, 53403

Scarvers, Tonya M.
Payroll Number:

1601




